EXTRAORDINARY M

REPUBLIC OF FIJI ISLANDS GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY OF THE FIJI GOVERNMENT

=% Vol. 11 WEDNESDAY 6th JANUARY 2010 No. 10

GOVERNMENT OF FUI

CUSTOMS TARIFF (BUDGET AMENDMENT) DECREE 2010
(DECREE NoO. 10 OF 2010)

IN exercise of the powers vested in me as President of the Republic of Fiji and the Commander in Chief of the Republic
of Fiji Military Forces by virtue of the Executive Authority Decree 2009, I hereby make the following Decree —

Short title and commencement

1 i iy T h-_“_._,.._._,l__ 2 = | 1. ¥ o [, | - S A s IYN 2l o & en mge Y ionmatN TN o o (2600 2 T - 2 .
| B8 11115 LJCLICC muy pDE CItEd as g Ludonns 14l lff ACL \Duugcl Ancnuaimeciit) eclice ,_LUIU dana coes i
force on 27th November 2009.

Section 10 amended
2. Section 10 of the Customs Tariff Act of 1986 (“the Act”) is amended —

(i) by inserting the following: “and import excise duty” after the word “fiscal duty” under subsection
10(1)"; and
(i) by deleting “$1,000.00 and substituting “$10,000.00” under subsection 2.
Section 10A amended

3. Section 10A subsection (2) of the Act is amended by deleting “$1,000.00” and substituting
“$10,000.00”.

Section 11 amended

4. Section 11 subsection (2) of the Act is amended by deleting “$1.000.00” and substituting “$10,000.00”.

Section 15 amended

5. Section 15 subsection (3) of the Act is amended by deleting “$1,000.00” and substituting “$10,000.00”.

Section 16 amended

6. Section 16 subsection (4) of the Act is amended by deleting “$1,000.00” and substituting “$10,000.00”.

Section 16A inserted

7. The Act is amended by —

(1) inserting the a new section 16A immediately after the existing section 16 in Part III—
“16 A—(1) The Comptroller shall require that any applicant for refund of any duty, charge or
fee must have a bank account in a commercial trading bank in Fiji Islands;”;

(ii)  inserting subsection (2)-
“(2) The Comptroller shall refrain from refunding any duty, charge or fee directly to claimants;”

Section 17 amended
8. Section 17 of the Act is amended in—

(i)  subsection (3) by deleting “$1,000.00” and substituting “$10,000.00”; and
(ii)  subsection (4) by deleting “$1,000.00” and substituting “$10,000.00™.

Section 22 amended

9. Section 22 subsection (2) of the Act is amended by deleting “$1,000.00” and substituting “$10,000.00™.






