[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 2|
CUSTOMS TARIFF ACT 1986

(ACTNO. 12 OF 1986)

Customs Tariff (Industrial Rebates) (Budget
Amendment) Regulations 2010

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by Section 22 of Customs Tari ff Act, 1986,

I make these regulations —
Citation and commencement

I. These Regulations may be cited as the Customs Tariff (Industrial Rebates) (Budget
Amendment) Regulations 2010 and comes into force on 1st January 2010.

Regulation 7 amended
2. Regulation 7 paragraph (¢) of the Regulations is amended by deleting *$1.000( 0"
and substituting “$10,000.00".

Dated this | 1th day of January 2010,
1. V. BAINIMARAMA
Prime Minister and Minister for
Public Service, People’s Charter for Change.
Information. Achieves, Finance, National Planning,
Sugar, Provincial Development. Indigenous and Multi Ethnic Affairs

[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 3]
EXCISE ACT 1986

Excise (Valuation of Excisable Goods
(Budget Amendment) Regulations 2010

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by Section 86 of Excise Act. 1986, I make
these regulations —
Citation and commencement
I.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Excise (Valuation of Excisable Goods)
(Budget Amendment) Regulations 2010 and comes into force on st January 2010.

(2) Tn these Regulations, the Customs (Valuation of Excisable Goods) Regulations
1986.is referred to as “principal Regulations™.
Rewulation 12 amended
2. Regulation 12 of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting *$2.000.00™
and substituting “$10,000.00"™.

Dated this 11th day of January 2010.
J. V. BAINIMARAMA
Prime Minister and Minister for
Public Service, People’s Charter for Change,
Information. Achieves. Finance, National Planning,
Sugar, Provincial Development, Indigenous and Multi Ethnic Affairs



9

[LEGAL NOTICE NoO. 4]
CUSTOMS ACT 1986
(ACT NO. 11 OF 1986)

Customs (Budget Amendment) Regulations 2010

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by Section 191 of Customs Act, 1986. | make
these regulations —
Citation and commencement
l.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Customs (Budget Amendment)
Regulations 2010 and shall commence on the 1st January 2010,

(2) In these Regulations, the Customs Regulations 1986 is referred to as “principal
Regulations™.
Regulation 3 amended
2. Regulation 3 of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting ~$2 000.00™
and substituting “$10.,000.007.

Regulation 10 amended
3. Regulation 10 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(i) renumbering the existing provision as sub-regulation (1) of regulation 10;
and

(ii) by inserting new sub-regulations —

“(2) The provisions of Regulations 10 (1) (¢} shall not apply —

(i) inthe case of asufferance wharf with an approved boarding station
expressly for foreign pleasure yachts. approved for temporary
import under Code 228 of the part 11 of Schedule I1 to the Customs
Tariff Act, 1986 and, such place is licensed by the Comptroller
under the provisions of Section 4 (3) of the Customs Act 1986;

(ii) if the attendance of the officer is requested within the scope of
Regulation 6.

Dated this 11th day of January 2010.

1. V. BAINIMARAMA

Prime Minister and Minister for

Public Service, People’s Charter for Change,

Information. Achieves, Finance, National Planning.

Sugar, Provincial Development, Indigenous and Multi Ethnic Affairs



10

[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 3]
CUSTOMS ACT 1986
(ACT NO. L1 OF 1986)

Customs (Prohibited Imports and Exports)
(Budget Amendment) Regulations 2010

IN exercise of the powers conferred on me by Section 64 of the Customs Act, 1986, I make

these regulation—
Citation and conmencement

|.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Customs (Prohibited Imports and
Exports) (Budget Amendment) Regulations 2010 and comes into force on Ist January
2010.

(2) Inthese Regulations, the Customs (Prohibited Imports and Exports) Regulations.
1986, is referred to as the “principal Regulations™.
Regulation 3 amended
2. Regulation 3 of the principal Regulations is amended by —

(i) renumbering the existing provision as Regulation 3 paragraph (1):
(i) deleting *$2,000.00” and substituting “$10.000.00"; and
(ili) inserting new sub-regulation—

“(2). If any substance to which this Regulation applies is unlawfully
imported, in very small quantity, the same be peremptorily seized, and
destroyed in any way the Comptroller may direct w ithout any further
proceedings.”

Regulation 10 amended
3. Regulation 10 of the principal Regulations is amended by—

(i)  renumbering the existing provision as sub-regulation 10 paragraph (1)
(i) inserting the following new sub-regulation—

“(2). Ifany substance to whichthis Regulation applies is unlawfully exported,
in very small quantity, the same shall be peremptorily seized, and
destroyed in any way the Comptroller may direct without any further
proceedings.”

Regulation 15 amended
4. Regulation 15 of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting *$2,000.00™
and substituting “$10.,000.00".

Dated this 11th day of January 2010,
1. V.BAINIMARAMA
Prime Minister and Minister for
Public Service, People’s Charter for Change,
Information. Achieves, Finance, National Planning,
Sugar, Provincial Development, Indigenous and Multi Ethnic Affairs



11

[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 6]
EXCISE ACT 1986

Excise (Budget Amenaent) Regulations 2010

IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by Section 86 of Excise Act. 1986, 1 make

these regulation—
Citation and conumencement

l.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Excise (Budget Amendment)
Regulations 2010 and comes into force on Ist January 2010,

(2) Inthese Regulations, the Customs Regulations, 1986, are referred to as “principal
Regulations”.
Regulativn 6 amended
2. Regulation 6 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(i) under subsection (5) by deleting “$2.000.00" and substituting
“$10.000.00™;

(i1) under subsection (7) by deleting *$2.000.00" and substituting “$10,000.00™;
and

(i) under subsection (10) by deleting “$2.,000.00" and substituting
“$10.000.007;

Regulation 7 amended
3. Regulation 7 sub regulation (5) of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting
“$2.000.00" and substituting “$10,000.00".

Regulation 8 amended
4. Regulation 8 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(i) under subsection (2) by deleting “$2.000.00™ and substituting “$10.,000.00;
and
(i) under subsection (4) by deleting “$2,000.007 and substituting “$10,000",

Revudation 9 amended
5. Regulation 9 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations is amended by deleting
“$2.000.00™ and substituting *$10,000.00",

Regwlation 10 amended
6. Regulation 10 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10.000.00™,

4 Regularion 1 amended
7. Regulation 11 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “$2.000.00™ and substituting “$10.000.00™.

Regularion 12 amended
8. Regulation 12 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting *$10,000.00™.
Regulation 13 amended
9. Regulation 13 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations is amended by
deleting *$2.000.00™ and substituting *$10.,000.00™.



10, Regulation 14 sub regulation (2) of the

“$1

deleting

1.
deleting “$2

12
deleting “$2

I3, Regulation 17 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

deleting “%2

14. Regulation 18 sub regul

deleting “$2

I5. Regulation 19 sub

deleting “$2

16. Regulation

deleting §2

17, Regulation

deleting “$2

18.  Regulation

deleting “$2

19, Regulation

deleting “$2

20. Regulation

deleting “$2

21.
deleting “$2

22. Regulation

deleting “$2

23. Regulation 27 sub regulation (2) of the

deleting “$2

Regulation 15 sub regulation (3) of the

Regulation 16 sub regulation (3) of the

Regulation

12

Regnlation 14 amerided
principal Regulations
000.00" and substituting “$10,000.00".

Regulation 15 amended

000.00" and substituting “$10.000.00".

Regulation 16 amended
principal Regulations
tuting “$10.000.00™,

Regulation 17 amended

000.00" and substi

000.00™ and substituting “$10,000.00".

Regudation 18 wmended
ation (3) of the principal Regulations
ng “$10.000.00".

Regulation 19 amendvd
regulation (3) of the principal Regulations
000.00™ and substituting “$10.,000.00"

Regulation 20 amended
20 sub regulation (3) of the
and substituting “$10.000.00".

Regulation 21 amended
21 sub regulation (3) of the
and substituting “$10,000,00”.

Regulution 22 amended
22 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations
and substituting “$10.000.00"

Regulation 23 amended
23 sub regulation (2) of the
and substituting “$10.000.00"

Regulation 24 umended
24 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations
and substituting “$10.000.00".

Regulation 25 amended
25 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations
and substituting “$10.000.00"

Regulation 26 amended

26 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations
£00.00" and substituting “$10.,000.00"

Regulution 27 amended

000.00" and substituti

000.00"

000.00™

000.00"

000.00™

000.00™

L000.00™

000,00 and substituting “$10.000.00".

principal Regulations i

principal Regulations

principal Regulations i

principal Regulations

principal Regulations i

o

w

-

wn

v

=

-

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by



/3

Regularion 28 amended
24. Regulation

deleting *$2.000.00™ and substituting “$10.000.00".

Regularion 29 amended
25. Regulation

deleting “$2.,000.00" and substituting “$10.000.00"".

Regulation 30 ameded
26. Regulation

deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10.,000.00".

Regulation 31 amended
27. Regulation

deleting *$2,000.00" and substituting “$10.000.00".

Regulation 32 amended
28. Regulation

deleting “$2.000.00™ and substituting “$10,000.00".

Regulution 33 amended
29. Regulation

deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10.000.00",

Regulation 34 amended
30. Regulation

deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10,000.00".

Regulation 43 amended
31. Regulation

deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10,000.00".

Reguilation 36 amended
32. Regulation

deleting *$2,000.00” and substituting “$10.000.00".

Regalation 37 amended
33. Regulation
deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10.,000.00".

Regulation 38 amended

34. Regulation 38 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10,000.00".

Regularion 39 amendid

35, Regulation 39 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10.000.00",

Regudation 40 amended

36. Regulation 40 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

deleting “$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10.000.00".

Regulation 41 amended
37. Regulation 41 sub regulation (4) of the principal Regulations
deleting *$2,000.00™ and substituting “$10.000.00™,

28 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations i

29 sub regulation (4) of the principal Regulations i

30 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

31 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

32 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

33 sub regulation (2) of the principal Regulations i

34 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

35 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

36 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

37 sub regulation (3) of the principal Regulations i

=

e

-
i

)

&

-

@

73

b

=

=

w

is

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by

amended by






