1292

(d) by deleting the following paragraph which was the proviso to paragraph (a), (b) and (c) in column 7 of
concession code 228;

“Provided the ship or aircraft was not previously admitted in Fiji under this Code 228 paragraphs
(a), (b) and (c), and if so, the ship or aircraft must not re enter Fiji for a period of not less than 9
months.”

(e) by deleting paragraph numbers “(c)” and “(d)” of concession code 228 and substituting it with numbers
“(b)7 and “(c)” respectively; ,
(f) by deleting paragraph (ii) in column 3 of concession code 235 and substituting with the following:
“ii. Specialized water sports equipment (e.g. water jet-ski,
water bike and other similar goods as the Comptroller
may approve which are not manufactured and available
in Fiji”;
(g) by deleting the expression “3%” in column 4 of concession code 236(iii) and substituting it with the
expression “5%”;

(h) by deleting the expression “Cable and wireless or any other similar organizations approved by the
Minister” in column 2 of concession code 237 and substituting it with the expression “Approved
companies for International cable laying and maintenance”.

GIVEN UNDER MY HAND this day 30th day of December, 2008.

J. 1. ULUIVUDA
President of the Republic of the Fiji Islands

[2048]
INTERIM GOVERNMENT OF THE REPUBLIC OF THE FLJI ISLANDS

AIRPORT DEPARTURE TAX ACT (BUDGET AMENDMENT) PROMULGATION 2008
(PROMULGATION NO. 37 OF 2008)

IN EXERCISE of the powers conferred upon the Interim Government, and upon the exercise of my own deliberate
judgment as President of the Republic of the Fiji Islands as to what is best and good for the people of the Republic of
the Fiji Islands, and by exercise of the executive authority of the State in accordance with section 85 of the Constitution
and such other powers as may appertain, and with the approvai of the Cabinet, i, Josefa iioilovatu Uluivuda, make
this Promulgation—

TO AMEND THE AIRPORT DEPARTURE TAX ACT 1986

Short title and commencement
_ 1. This Promulgation may be cited as the Airport Departure Tax Act (Budget Amendment) Promulgation 2008,
and is deemed to have come into force on 1 January 2009.

Section 3 amended

; 2. The Airport Departure Tax Act 1986 is amended in section 3 by deleting “$40” and substituting it with
“$75”.

GIVEN UNDER MY HAND this 3 st day of December 2008.

J. 1. ULUIVUDA
President of the Republic of the Fiji Islands

Pnce: $2.10 ~ R.S.OLI, Acting Government Printer, Suva, Fiji—2009 1SRIFGG/2009— 1,200
Official Printer Since 1883



